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Walking together towards
a greener future.

Summary
In collaboration with the residents of
Kypseli, a central district of Athens,
the ‘3-30-300 ATHENS’ project seeks
to thoroughly assess the area’s urban
composition against the 3-30-300 rule
for urban forestry and green spaces.
Through citizen engagement and
creative green city interventions, the
project aims to map the current green
topology using both digital and analog
techniques. Additionally, these
mapping activities, workshops, and
green initiatives will not only identify
areas needing future development but
also raise awareness among residents
about the numerous benefits of green
surroundings and engage them in the
area's redesign. Ultimately, the project
aspires to empower citizens and
inspire a citizen-led transformation of
Athens into a green city of the future.
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