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Participating in IMPETUS through SCI-FI
empowers communities with citizen

science, fostering sustainable agriculture
and environmental and social innovation.

Summary
The SCI-FI (SCIence For Inclusion) project aims to
foster environmental preservation and social
inclusion by integrating sustainable agricultural
practices with community engagement.

 Conducted in the Friuli Venezia Giulia region of
Italy, the project trains vulnerable citizens and
farmers as citizen scientists to collect field data,
refining agronomic models and promoting precision
agriculture. Key activities include installing weather
stations, conducting workshops on climate
resilience and sustainable farming, and developing
a digital platform for data dissemination. By
engaging rural communities in technology
development and application, the project seeks to
reduce distrust towards European initiatives and
elucidate the scientific reasons behind sustainable
agricultural technologies. This blend of science,
technology, and society applied to the agrifood
sector aligns with the Agenda 2030 goals,
emphasizing the importance of citizen science. 

The ultimate goal is to enhance digital
transformation in agriculture while improving the
social and psychological well-being of participants,
fostering a more inclusive and sustainable
community.
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